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ABSTRACT 

In an era marked by mental health challenges and the quest for holistic well-being, spiritual literature offers a 
profound and transformative approach to healing. This paper explores the concept of spiritual healing through 

literature, focusing on texts rooted in the teachings of the Brahma Kumaris, including God's Healing Power by 

Brahma Kumari Jayanti and The Power of One Thought by BK Shivani. Central to this exploration are the 
philosophies encapsulated in the Brahma Kumaris' daily murlis—divine teachings attributed to Shiv Baba, the 

Supreme Soul, who is regarded as the eternal father and guide for all souls. 

The Brahma Kumaris philosophy underscores that true healing originates from the alignment of the soul with 
the Supreme Soul. The murlis serve as a spiritual compass, imparting wisdom that transcends material existence 

and emphasizes virtues like purity, peace, and universal love. These teachings foster mindfulness, emotional 

resilience, and self-transformation, laying the foundation for lasting mental well-being. This paper highlights 

how the spiritual literature of the Brahma Kumaris integrates universal principles with practical insights, 
offering a framework for overcoming stress, anxiety, and despair. 

Key texts like God’s Healing Power delve into the transformative potential of divine connection in restoring 

inner harmony, while The Power of One Thought illustrates the profound impact of thought discipline and soul 
consciousness in shaping emotional and mental health. Together, these works illuminate pathways to self-

empowerment and collective well-being. By examining the integration of these texts with the daily murli 

teachings, the paper sheds light on how spiritual literature can serve as a therapeutic medium to foster healing, 

resilience, and sustainability. 

Further, the study positions the Brahma Kumaris’ spiritual philosophy as an alternative thinking model that 

bridges disciplines—psychology, education, and spirituality—for a sustainable future. Through an analysis of 

the healing narratives and teachings, this paper argues that spiritual literature rooted in divine wisdom addresses 
mental health holistically, offering an inclusive and enduring path to self-realization and global harmony. This 

interdisciplinary inquiry advocates for the inclusion of spiritual literature in mental health discourses, not only 

as a source of solace but also as a means to transform human consciousness, align with higher values, and 
nurture a sustainable society. By invoking the timeless wisdom of Shiv Baba, this paper reaffirms the enduring 

relevance of spirituality in addressing contemporary mental health challenges. 
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Resilience, Self-Transformation, Spiritual Literature, Mental Health Sustainability, Healing Narratives. 

INTRODUCTION 

Healing is an intrinsic aspect of human experience, extending beyond the physical realm to encompass 

emotional, mental, and spiritual well-being. In today’s fast-paced world, emotional and mental health challenges 
are increasingly widespread, prompting a need for more sustainable and holistic healing approaches. Spiritual 

teachings offer a profound method of healing, one that addresses not only the mind and body but also the soul. 

Among these spiritual teachings, the Brahma Kumaris stand out for their transformative perspective, which 
encourages a shift from material consciousness to soul consciousness. 

The Brahma Kumaris is a Global Spiritual University founded in India in 1937, dedicated to personal 

transformation and world renewal. With its spread to over 140 countries, it has reached millions of people, 

empowering them to transform their perspective of the world from the material to the spiritual. This shift 
enables individuals to cultivate deep inner peace, emotional resilience, and self-awareness. The core of Brahma 

Kumaris' teachings lies in recognizing the soul’s connection with the Supreme Soul (Shiv Baba) and fostering 

relationships based on spiritual consciousness, which leads to emotional healing. 

The teachings of the Brahma Kumaris, as found in texts such as God's Healing Power by Brahma Kumari 

Jayanti and The Power of One Thought by BK Shivani, provide practical and accessible tools for healing. 

Central to these teachings is the idea that soul consciousness and a connection with the divine bring about 

emotional and mental well-being. These texts emphasize the power of elevated thoughts, meditation, and 
spiritual alignment in overcoming emotional distress. This paper explores how these teachings, especially the 
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daily murlis of the Brahma Kumaris, offer a comprehensive approach to mental health, providing a sustainable 

method for resilience, healing, and personal transformation. 

LITERATURE REVIEW 
The Brahma Kumaris offer a spiritual framework that integrates meditation, mindfulness, and soul 

consciousness to heal emotional and mental suffering. The movement's philosophy stresses that healing occurs 

when an individual aligns their soul with the Supreme Soul (Shiv Baba), transcending the limitations of body 

consciousness. Body consciousness, which often links a person’s identity to their role in society, is seen as the 
root of emotional distress and imbalance. The shift to soul consciousness—seeing oneself as an eternal soul 

connected to the Supreme Soul—liberates individuals from the burdens of material existence and helps foster 

emotional resilience and spiritual strength. 

God's Healing Power by Brahma Kumari Jayanti underscores the significance of reconnecting with the divine 

as a method of inner healing. Jayanti presents Shiv Baba, the Supreme Soul, as the ultimate healer, offering 

divine love and energy to heal emotional wounds. She emphasizes that healing is not about merely alleviating 
symptoms, but rather addressing the root causes of emotional distress. By practicing soul consciousness and 

meditation, individuals can access divine energy, transforming their mental and emotional states. Jayanti writes, 

―True healing originates from aligning the soul with the Supreme Soul‖ (Jayanti, 2020, p. 13). 

BK Shivani’s The Power of One Thought expands upon this idea by illustrating the power of thoughts in 
shaping emotional well-being. Shivani emphasizes that a single elevated thought can alter the course of one’s 

day, leading to profound changes in mental and emotional states. She encourages individuals to consciously 

direct their thoughts towards purity, love, and compassion, as these virtues generate emotional stability and 
resilience. Shivani explains, ―A single elevated thought can change the trajectory of a person’s emotional state‖ 

(Shivani, 2023, p. 18). This notion aligns with modern psychological theories of mindfulness and emotional 

regulation, which stress the importance of thought control in maintaining emotional balance. 

The daily murlis of the Brahma Kumaris act as the foundation for their healing philosophy. These teachings 
provide ongoing guidance on how to maintain soul consciousness and foster virtues such as love, purity, peace, 

happiness, power, knowledge and bliss. According to the murlis, true healing arises when individuals recognize 

that their relationships are with the divine rather than with others in their material roles. This shift in perspective 
fosters an environment of emotional and mental well-being, as individuals are no longer weighed down by 

societal expectations and external pressures. 

RESULTS AND DISCUSSION 

Soul Consciousness as the Foundation of Healing 

One of the fundamental teachings of the Brahma Kumaris is the idea of soul consciousness. When individuals 

view themselves as souls, rather than as bodies defined by societal roles, they are liberated from the emotional 

weight associated with body consciousness. For example, the societal expectations placed on individuals in 
roles such as a mother, father, or spouse often led to emotional stress and self-criticism. If an individual fails to 

meet these expectations, they may internalize feelings of inadequacy or guilt, believing that they are not 

fulfilling their duties correctly. However, by remembering that their true nature is soul consciousness, 
individuals can free themselves from these burdens. 

As souls, their original nature is inherently happy, peaceful, pure, loveful, blissful, knowledgeful, and powerful. 

These intrinsic qualities do not require external validation or confirmation. This realization helps individuals 
gain self-confidence, as they come to understand that their true self-esteem arises from within, not from the 

external circumstances or roles they occupy. By practicing Rajyog meditation and consciously choosing to 

connect with the Almighty, individuals can experience this deep inner connection and recognize that their sense 

of worth and power is totally within their control. Guided by the wisdom of Shiv Baba, they can maintain 
emotional resilience and peace, irrespective of external pressures. Thus, the practice of soul consciousness helps 

individuals discover their authentic self, grounded in spiritual strength and self-respect. 

As one reflects on the murlis, the inner dialogue shifts. Instead of saying, ―I am a mother and I am not living up 
to the standards set by society,‖ the individual can remind themselves, ―I am a soul, and my true nature is to be 

loving and pure. All relationships are with the Supreme Soul, not with physical beings.‖ This shift in 

perspective enables individuals to approach their roles with greater compassion and self-respect. By embracing 

soul consciousness, individuals can perform their duties with love, without the weight of societal pressures. 

As Shiv Baba reminds in one murli, "You are not subjects; you are kings. You are the ones who have a right to 

the double kingdom—self-sovereignty and the sovereignty of the world" (Avyakt Murli, 2003, November 15). 
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This royal identity fosters a sense of self-respect and empowers individuals to approach life's challenges with 

dignity and confidence. 

The Transformative Power of Elevated Thoughts 
Another critical aspect of the Brahma Kumaris’ teachings is the transformative power of elevated thoughts. 

Both the murlis and The Power of One Thought emphasize that thoughts shape emotional states and can 

significantly impact one's experiences. Elevated thoughts—those grounded in virtues such as peace, love, and 

purity—create a ripple effect that influences not only the individual’s emotional state but also their interactions 
with others. 

As BK Shivani explains, a single elevated thought can shift one's perspective and lead to emotional healing. She 

suggests that individuals can protect themselves from negative emotions and external stressors by consciously 
cultivating thoughts of purity, love, and compassion. By practicing this approach, individuals can create a 

mental and emotional environment that fosters resilience and stability, enabling them to navigate life’s 

challenges with ease. BK Shivani states, ―Every thought is a seed. When planted in the soil of soul 
consciousness, it bears fruits of peace and happiness‖ (Shivani, 2023, p. 25). 

In the murlis, Shiv Baba emphasizes the importance of elevated thoughts for healing, stating, ―To have purity in 

thoughts means always to have good wishes and pure feelings for everyone‖ (Avyakt Murli, 2003, November 

15). Elevated thoughts, rooted in virtues like peace and compassion, not only heal the individual but also create 
a ripple effect of positive energy, spreading healing to others. 

Divine Connection and Emotional Resilience 

The connection with the Supreme Soul is another powerful source of emotional resilience. As Brahma Kumari 
Jayanti explains in God’s Healing Power, regular meditation and connection with the divine recharge the 

individual’s emotional batteries, providing an infinite source of love and energy. This divine connection helps 

individuals navigate life's stresses and challenges with greater peace and clarity. Through regular meditation 

and remembrance of Shiv Baba, individuals can strengthen their emotional resilience, enabling them to remain 
calm and centered in the face of adversity. 

Jayanti writes, ―God’s love is transformative, enabling individuals to overcome stress and other emotional 

challenges‖ (Jayanti, 2020, p. 21). This divine connection provides an unlimited source of strength and healing 
that supports individuals through their emotional struggles, fostering emotional resilience. 

Holistic Healing through Spiritual Literature 

The spiritual literature of the Brahma Kumaris offers a holistic approach to healing that integrates the mind, 
body, and soul. Unlike conventional therapies that often focus on addressing specific symptoms, the Brahma 

Kumaris’ teachings address the root causes of emotional and mental imbalance. The practices of soul 

consciousness, meditation, and elevated thinking provide a sustainable model of emotional well-being, 

promoting long-term healing and personal transformation. This holistic approach is grounded in the belief that 
the soul’s connection with the Supreme Soul is the key to overcoming all forms of suffering. 

As the murlis affirm, ―True healing originates from aligning the soul with the Supreme Soul. Only by 

reconnecting with God can we dissolve the impurities within and reclaim our innate purity‖ (Avyakt Murli, 
2003, November 15). Through this alignment with the divine, individuals can overcome emotional distress and 

experience lasting healing. 

CONCLUSION 
The teachings of the Brahma Kumaris, as articulated in their daily murlis and texts like God’s Healing Power 

and The Power of One Thought, offer a transformative approach to mental health and emotional well-being. By 

focusing on soul consciousness, elevated thoughts, and divine connection, these teachings provide a framework 

for healing that transcends traditional therapeutic methods. The practical and accessible nature of these 
teachings makes them a valuable resource for individuals seeking emotional resilience, self-transformation, and 

lasting peace. 

This paper highlights the relevance of spiritual literature in addressing contemporary mental health challenges 
and emphasizes its role as a therapeutic medium for promoting global harmony and individual well-being. By 

incorporating the wisdom of Shiv Baba into daily life, individuals can cultivate emotional resilience, foster self-

respect, and contribute to a more peaceful and harmonious world. 
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